

District Court, Weld County, Colorado Address: P.O. Box 2038 Greeley, CO 80632	
CRAIG D. BUCKLEY, an individual,  vs.  DREAM STONE, INC., a Colorado corporation, SCOTT MURPHY, an individual, EVE MURPHY, an individual, RON MURPHY, an individual	<b>▲ COURT USE ONLY ▲</b>
Attorneys for Defendants: Daniel T. Goodwin, #2971 Blaine D. Bowne, #24481 Donelson Ciancio & Goodwin, PC 8001 Arista Place, Suite 400 Broomfield, Colorado 80021 Telephone: 303-450-1665 Fax: 303-457-1175 E-mail: dangoodwin@colo-law.com blainebowne@colo-law.com	Case No. 2009CV991  Division: 1  Courtroom: Judge Hartman
<b>EXHIBIT TO AFFIDAVIT OF ATTORNEYS' FEES</b>	

This Firm has worked on this case and billed the Defendants for a total of fifteen and five tenths (15.5) hours in the amount of \$1,630.50. The work performed on behalf of the Defendants is set forth with specificity as follows:

RE: MOTION FOR JOINDER OF PARTIES filed December 1, 2009

<i>Date</i>	<i>Activity</i>	<i>Staff</i>	<i>Time</i>	<i>Rate</i>	<i>Total</i>
12/1/09	Receive multiple pleadings from opposing parties; scan to file and attorneys	JLB	.2	115	N/C
12/2/09	Docket deadline to respond to Motion for Joinder of Parties; inter-office conference with J. Bennett regarding same.	CME	.1	125	12.50
12/14/09	Preparation of drafts to Plaintiffs' Motion.	DTG	.4	350	140.00
12/15/09	Revise drafts of responses.	DTG	.3	350	105.00
12/16/09	Preparation of Affidavit of M. Matthews; e-mail to Matthews.	DTG	.8	350	280.00
12/17/09	Review e-mail from M. Matthews.	DTG	.1	350	11.50
12/17/09	Telephone call to M. Matthews; revise response to motion for joinder of parties.	DTG	.9	350	315.00

12/18/09	E-file multiple pleadings.	JLB	.7	115	N/C
2/17/10	Review Order Denying Plaintiff's Motion to Join Daniel Goodwin and Blaine Bowne (pleading states Browne) as Parties; docket deadlines re same.	CME	.2	125	25.00
	<b>Totals</b>		3.7		\$889.00

Costs:

12/18/2009	Lexis online filing charges	\$6.00
12/18/2009	Lexis online filing charges	\$6.00
	<b>Total Costs</b>	\$12.00

To summarize, the Defendants have been billed three and seven tenths (3.7) hours and costs of \$12.00 for a total charge of Nine Hundred One dollars (\$901.00) (this total does not include the time for preparing this affidavit) in defense of the Motion for Joinder of Parties.

RE: PLAINTIFFS SECOND MOTION FOR JOINDER OF PARTIES AND MOTION FOR LEAVE TO AMEND COMPLAINT filed December 11, 2009

<i>Date</i>	<i>Activity</i>	<i>Staff</i>	<i>Time</i>	<i>Rate</i>	<i>Total</i>
12/14/09	Preparation of drafts to Plaintiffs' Motion.	DTG	.4	350	140.00
12/15/09	Revise drafts of responses.	DTG	.3	350	105.00
12/15/09	Docket deadline to file response to Plaintiffs' Second Motion for Joinder of Parties.	CME	.1	125	12.5
12/17/09	Revise response to motion for joinder of parties.	DTG	.9	350	315.00
12/18/09	Finalize Response to Second Motion for Joinder.	JLB	.1	115	N/C
12/18/09	E-file multiple pleadings.	JLB	.7	115	N/C
1/14/10	Docket deadline to file response to Retraction of Plaintiffs' Second Motion for Joinder of Parties.	CME	.1	125	12.50
2/17/10	Review Order Regarding Plaintiffs' Second Motion for Joinder of Parties; docket deadlines regarding same.	CME	.2	125	25.00
	<b>Totals</b>		2.8		\$610.00

Costs:

12/18/.90	Lexis online filing charges	\$6.00
	Total Costs	\$6.00

To summarize, the Defendants have been billed two and eight tenths (2.8) hours and costs of \$6.00 for a total charge of Six Hundred Sixteen Dollars (\$616.00) (this total does not include the time for preparing this affidavit) in defense of the Plaintiffs Second Motion for Joinder of Parties and Motion for Leave to Amend Complaint.

RE: PLAINTIFFS MOTION FOR JOINDER OF PARTY - JUAN MIRELES filed on January 14, 2010

<i>Date</i>	<i>Activity</i>	<i>Staff</i>	<i>Time</i>	<i>Rate</i>	<i>Total</i>
1/15/10	Docket deadline to respond to Plaintiffs' Motion for Joinder of Party – Juan Mireles.	CME	.1	125	12.50
1/18/10	Finalize and e-file response.	JLB	.3	115	N/C
1/27/10	Receipt and review of Plaintiffs' Reply on Motion to Join Party.	DTG	.2	350	70.00
1/27/10	Review Plaintiffs' Reply to Response to Motion of Joinder of Party – Mireles.	CME	.2	125	25.00
2/12/10	Review Plaintiffs' Rebuttal to Sur-Reply Regarding Motion to Add Juan Mireles.	CME	.1	125	N/C
	<b>Totals</b>		0.9		\$107.50

Costs:

1/18/10	Lexis online filing charges	\$6.00
	Total Costs	\$6.00

To summarize, the Defendants have been billed nine tenths (.9) hours and costs of \$6.00 for a total charge of One Hundred Thirteen and 50/100 (\$113.50) (this total does not include the time for preparing this affidavit) in defense of the Plaintiffs Motion for Joinder of Party - Juan Mireles.

**CERTIFICATE OF ELECTRONIC SERVICE**

I do hereby certify that on this 1st day of March, 2010, a true and correct copy of the foregoing EXHIBIT TO AFFIDAVIT OF ATTORNEYS' FEES was served via Lexis/Nexis File & Serve:

Craig Buckley

[REDACTED]  
Longmont, CO 80501

s/Janice Bennett\_\_\_\_\_